
As-Submitted Results Report v1

July 11, 2022 November 8, 2024

$45,402,162.16

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

15.87 %

$52,607,715.69

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

9.68 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, drainage, signing and pavement markings on I-75 from south of Levering
Road to north of US-31, Cheboygan County.  This project includes a 5 year materials and workmanship pavement
warranty.

001

NH 16092-130014

As-SubmitttedBidder

J & N Construction, LLC $52,607,715.69

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $52,767,647.64

Payne & Dolan Inc. $53,554,099.75

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 10, 2023

$16,356,534.29

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

9.37 %

$17,888,328.90

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.46 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling, resurfacing and 2 bridge rehabilitations including pavement joint and crack
repairs, curb and gutter replacement, sidewalk upgrades, signing, guardrail, signal modernizations and pavement
markings on US-12 (Michigan Avenue) from Elm Street to Firestone Street in the city of Dearborn, Wayne County.
This project includes two 5 year materials and workmanship pavement warranties. This project is an OJT VIP
project.  Please see Special Provision for Preparation and Consideration of Bids on On-The-Job Training Voluntary
Incentive Program Projects.

002

ST 82062-210083 , ETC

21.5538

21-5538

As-SubmitttedBidder

Ajax Paving Industries, Inc. $17,888,328.90

Cadillac Asphalt, L.L.C. $19,206,003.36

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 18, 2023

$993,533.95

No DBE participation required

2205

32.03 %

$1,311,792.17

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge reconstruction including removal and replacement with span timber laminated deck and approach work on
County Road 448 over Stutts Creek, Schoolcraft County.  This is a Local Agency project.

003

MCS 75000-208086

22-5091

As-SubmitttedBidder

Zenith Tech, Inc. $1,311,792.17

Hebert Construction Co. $1,479,405.30

A. Lindberg & Sons, Inc. $1,492,364.05

3Total Number of Bidders:



July 11, 2022 July 11, 2023

$564,574.75

No DBE participation required

2205

9.89 %

$620,399.75

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.13 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, concrete curb, gutter and sidewalks and ramps and
pavement markings on Washington Avenue N from Goodale Avenue south to Michigan Avenue (M-89) in the city of
Battle Creek, Calhoun County. This is a Local Agency project.

004

STUL 13000-207347

22-5103

As-SubmitttedBidder

Lakeland Asphalt Corporation $620,399.75

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $641,713.62

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $708,943.35

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 29, 2022

$1,257,711.00

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

8.41 %

$1,363,483.10

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.27 mi of concrete shared-use path, retaining wall, guardrail, fencing and sidewalk ramps along Plaster Creek
Boulevard between Division Street and Buchanan Avenue in the city of Wyoming, Kent County.  This is a Local
Agency project.

005

TAU 41000-213133

22-5088

As-SubmitttedBidder

Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. $1,363,483.10

Anlaan Corporation $1,697,715.75

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 31, 2022

$288,877.90

No DBE participation required

2205

-1.56 %

$284,380.86

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.45 mi of hot mix asphalt shared-use path, concrete curb, gutter and sidewalk ramps along the south side of the
Sault Power Canal from Ashmun Street to Johnston Street in the city of Sault Ste. Marie, Chippewa County.  This
is a Local Agency project.

006

TAUL 17000-213708

22-5092

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $284,380.86

Elmer's Crane and Dozer, Inc. $384,135.62

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 11, 2022 October 3, 2022

$958,536.50

No DBE participation required

2205

28.28 %

$1,229,581.71

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including expansion joint replacement, deck patching, crack sealing, epoxy overlay, clean and
coat steel beam ends, substructure repair and approach work on Waverly Road over the Grand River, Ingham
County.  This is a Local Agency project.

007

MCS 33000-209872

22-5098

As-SubmitttedBidder

Davis Construction, Inc. $1,229,581.71

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $2,451,013.07

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 30, 2023

$624,174.00

No DBE participation required

2205

-11.76 %

$550,794.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including epoxy overlay, deck patching, replace expansion joints, concrete surface coating,
penetrating healer sealer and approach work on Leffingwell Avenue and College Avenue over Grand Trunk
Railroad, Division Avenue over Plaster Creek and Alpine Avenue over Indian Mill Creek in the city of Grand Rapids,
Kent County.

008

BO 41000-209809 , ETC

22-5097

As-SubmitttedBidder

Anlaan Corporation $550,794.00

Grand River Construction, Inc. $585,312.00

Milbocker and Sons, Inc. $754,879.25

3Total Number of Bidders:



July 6, 2022 October 3, 2022

$432,748.60

No DBE participation required

2205

7.55 %

$465,402.46

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.14 mi of shoulder hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, bridge rehabilitation including heat straightening,
steel diaphragm replacement and partial painting of structural steel on US-23 Northbound and US-23 entrance
ramp B, Washtenaw County.

009

M 81103-209345

As-SubmitttedBidder

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $465,402.46

Z Contractors, Inc. $480,488.37

Grand River Construction, Inc. $534,537.54

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 20, 2022 May 25, 2023

$10,007,904.45

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

2.64 %

$10,271,762.80

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

10.50 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, shoulder widening, pavement repairs, concrete curb and
gutter, guardrail, drainage and pavement markings on M-46 from Towerline Road to M-15, Saginaw and Tuscola
Counties. This project includes a 5 year materials and workmanship pavement warranty.

010

NH 73063-201286

As-SubmitttedBidder

Pyramid Paving and Contracting Co. $10,271,762.80

Ace-Saginaw Paving Company $10,981,695.21

2Total Number of Bidders:



July 11, 2022 October 29, 2022

$293,093.00

No DBE participation required

2205

11.14 %

$325,737.60

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.14 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, concrete curb and gutter, drainage, signing and pavement markings on
Francis Road at Clark Road, Clinton County.  This is a Small Business Program project.  Only those approved by
MDOT as a Small Business may be eligible to bid as a prime contractor.  This is a Local Agency project.

011

HRRR 19000-211813

22-5128

As-SubmitttedBidder

C L Trucking & Excavating, LLC $325,737.60

Nashville Construction Company $336,785.16

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award July 8, 2022

$111,503.42

No DBE participation required

2205

5.73 %

$117,896.12

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Application of countywide pavement markings on various routes, Houghton County.  This is a Local Agency
project.

012

STL 31000-214784

22-5089

As-SubmitttedBidder

P.K. Contracting, LLC $117,896.12

Michigan Pavement Markings, LLC $152,632.68

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award July 15, 2022

$537,525.00

No DBE participation required

2205

5.62 %

$567,726.50

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.02 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling, crushing, shaping and resurfacing, aggregate shoulders and pavement
markings on Pelkie Road north of M-38, Baraga County.  This is a Local Agency project.

013

STL 07000-212793

22-5084

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $567,726.50

Bacco Construction Company $578,090.50

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 October 28, 2022

$299,470.00

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

16.71 %

$349,517.30

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation includes hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, bridge wearing surface, substructure
concrete patching of the pier caps, structural crack repair, deck joint repairs, concrete surface coating and
approach work on Beaverton Road and Glidden Road over Tobacco River, Gladwin County.  This is a Local
Agency project.

014

MCS 26000-206071 , ETC

22-5104

As-SubmitttedBidder

Grand River Construction, Inc. $349,517.30

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $407,846.48

Anlaan Corporation $422,299.72

3Total Number of Bidders:



May 31, 2022 September 2, 2022

$213,255.00

No DBE participation required

2205

9.03 %

$232,503.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation includes partial clean and coat of structural steel, concrete deck patching and guardrail work
on County Road 492 over Carp River in the city of Negaunee, Marquette County. This is a Local Agency project.

015

BO 52000-209864

22-5091

As-SubmitttedBidder

A. Lindberg & Sons, Inc. $232,503.00

Hebert Construction Co. $326,176.05

Atsalis Brothers Painting Co. $388,707.00

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 14, 2022

$164,669.00

No DBE participation required

2205

-24.35 %

$124,568.55

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including epoxy deck healer sealer overlay, silane treatment of bridge fascias and pavement
markings on 5 structures, Marquette County.  This is a Local Agency project.

016

BO 52000-209865 , ETC

22-5114

As-SubmitttedBidder

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, L.L.C. $124,568.55

Ram Construction Services of Michigan, Inc. $128,368.59

Smith's Waterproofing LLC $179,899.15

Hebert Construction Co. $277,658.32

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 7, 2022

$694,757.00

No DBE participation required

2205

20.59 %

$837,802.62

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.30 mi of hot mix asphalt base crushing, shaping and resurfacing, aggregate shoulders and pavement markings
on County Road 433 (River Road) from east of Scharstrom Road to east of the east approach of East Kendall
Road. This is a Local Agency project.

017

STL 75000-203314

22-5111

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $837,802.62

Bacco Construction Company $873,819.42

2Total Number of Bidders:



May 31, 2022 May 1, 2023

$4,804,494.61

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

51.35 %

$7,271,737.76

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

8.83 mi of hot mix asphalt spot rehabilitation on the shoulder and lane as needed, construction of multiple hot mix
asphalt crossovers and widening, concrete curb and gutter, culverts, sewer, drainage, guardrail, bridge
rehabilitation to include 54 inch prestressed concrete I-beams, steel sheet piling and pavement markings on I-94
eastbound over Pipestone Road and along I-94 from west of Puetz Road east to west of Britain Avenue, Berrien
County.

018

IM 11016-213266

As-SubmitttedBidder

Milbocker and Sons, Inc. $7,271,737.76

Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. $7,694,195.81

Kalin Construction Co., Inc. $7,859,567.44

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 October 14, 2022

$473,323.30

No DBE participation required

2205

21.66 %

$575,827.45

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Railroad crossing reconstruction and approach work on M-77 and M-94 at Wisconsin Central Railroad in the city of
Manistique, Schoolcraft County.

019

MRR 75051-213438

As-SubmitttedBidder

Bacco Construction Company $575,827.45

1Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 25, 2023

$510,376.70

No DBE participation required

2205

-15.04 %

$433,628.31

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Construct wetland mitigation site includes tree and shrub clearing, earth excavation, site grading, installation of
water control structures, signing, tree and shrub planting and seeding along 1 Mile Road in Ontonagon River
Watershed, Ontonagon County.

020

ST 66000-208502-2

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $433,628.31

Bacco Construction Company $486,204.55

WR Construction LLC $556,038.56

Snow Country Contracting, Inc. $597,314.56

MD Contracting, Inc. $674,744.02

5Total Number of Bidders:



June 13, 2022 September 30, 2022

$572,270.08

2.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-8.25 %

$525,084.63

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.04 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay, aggregate shoulders, guardrail and pavement markings on Maple City Highway
from Almira Road (CR-610) north to Oviatt Road, Benzie County.  This is a Local Agency project.

021

STL 10000-215049

22-5130

As-SubmitttedBidder

Elmer's Crane and Dozer, Inc. $525,084.63

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $557,072.58

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award September 30, 2022

$351,804.40

No DBE participation required

2205

0.01 %

$351,822.12

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.91 mi of hot mix asphalt base crushing, shaping, and resurfacing and pavement markings on Long Lake Road
from Lacombe Road south to US-23, Alpena County.  This is a Local Agency project.

022

HIC 04000-205306

22-5119

As-SubmitttedBidder

Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $351,822.12

Pyramid Paving and Contracting Co. $444,747.60

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $483,902.50

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 16, 2023

$2,268,563.06

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

44.54 %

$3,279,036.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

4.45 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, culverts, guardrail and pavement markings on Fillmore
Street/Cottonwood Drive from 48th Avenue easterly to Taylor Street, Ottawa County.  This is a Local Agency
project.

023

STU 70000-205535

22-5134

As-SubmitttedBidder

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $3,279,036.00

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $3,670,551.00

2Total Number of Bidders:



July 25, 2022 August 6, 2022

$612,825.54

2.00 % DBE participation required

2205

1.69 %

$623,194.84

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.83 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, aggregate shoulders, signing and pavement markings on
13th Street/Crosby Road from Plett Road to Division Street (M-55), Wexford County.  This is a Local Agency
project.

024

STUL 83000-132826

22-5132

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $623,194.84

Elmer's Crane and Dozer, Inc. $727,969.05

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 30, 2023

$2,355,098.50

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

8.03 %

$2,544,190.18

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge reconstruction includes 23 foot by 3 foot three sided concrete precast culvert and approach work on
Maloney Street over Clear Long Lake Canal, Oakland County.  This is a Local Agency project.

025

BO 63000-212274

22-5113

As-SubmitttedBidder

F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen & Associates LLC $2,544,190.18

Z Contractors, Inc. $3,275,444.70

Toebe Construction LLC $3,619,040.35

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $5,380,949.42

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 24, 2023

$219,575.69

No DBE participation required

2205

1.81 %

$223,558.42

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.46 mi of hot mix asphalt surfacing, gravel shoulders and pavement markings on Arthur L Jones Road from M-60
to Broadway Road, St. Joseph County.  This is a Local Agency project.

026

STL 78000-215178

22-5124

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $223,558.42

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $248,517.26

Lakeland Asphalt Corporation $279,904.60

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 14, 2022

$481,987.05

No DBE participation required

2205

-11.22 %

$427,899.12

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.13 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay, signing and pavement markings on Kelly Johnson Memorial Drive (County
Road 460) from M-553 to Tenth Street, Marquette County.  This is a Local Agency project.

027

STL 52000-214888

22-5123

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $427,899.12

Bacco Construction Company $472,997.72

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 30, 2023

$2,029,098.15

No DBE participation required

2205

-23.77 %

$1,546,685.25

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge reconstruction including one-span, 36-inch prestressed concrete bulb tee beams, cast-in-place concrete
abutments, steel h-piles, cofferdams, culverts, sewer, drainage, concrete curb and gutter, bridge approach and
pavement markings on Woodruff Road over Coldwater River, Isabella County.  This is a Local Agency project.

028

MCS 37000-209804

22-5126

As-SubmitttedBidder

Miller Development, Inc. $1,546,685.25

J. E. Kloote Contracting, Inc. $1,654,118.96

Hardman Construction, Inc. $1,752,879.54

Grand River Construction, Inc. $1,768,812.09

E.T. MacKenzie Company $1,930,136.83

Milbocker and Sons, Inc. $1,978,780.38

The Beaver Excavating Co. $2,688,055.59

7Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205 Low Bid:  

Engineer Estimate:  

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:  

Completion Date: September 16, 2022 

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.46 mi of hot mix asphalt cold mill, crush, shape and resurface, concrete curb and ramps, sewer and pavement
markings on Lemon Creek Road from Cleveland Avenue to First Street in the village of Baroda, Berrien County.
This is a Local Agency project.

029

HIC 11000-212913

22-5122

 
 
 

All Bids Rejected 
 
 
5/26/2022 



10 days after award October 31, 2022

$416,848.24

No DBE participation required

2205

4.15 %

$434,134.72

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.07 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay, gravel shoulders and pavement markings on Angevine Road from Wakerman
Road to North Angling Street, St. Joseph County.  This is a Local Agency project.

030

STL 78000-214461

22-5090

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $434,134.72

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $468,283.36

Lakeland Asphalt Corporation $486,052.52

3Total Number of Bidders:



March 4, 2023 October 25, 2024

$3,429,869.76

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-6.32 %

$3,213,053.15

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.50 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, concrete curb, gutter, sidewalk and ramps, storm sewer, water main and
pavement markings on College Avenue from Leonard Street northerly to Sweet Street in the city of Grand Rapids,
Kent County.  This is a Local Agency project.

031

STU 41000-205518

22-5106

As-SubmitttedBidder

Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. $3,213,053.15

Davis Construction, Inc. $3,315,528.15

Wyoming Excavators, Inc. $3,367,067.00

Georgetown Construction Company $3,416,052.25

Schippers Excavating, Inc. $3,425,527.00

Nagel Construction, Inc. $3,771,740.75

Diversco Construction Company, Inc. $3,866,226.60

7Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award November 11, 2022

$1,199,961.00

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

18.89 %

$1,426,576.10

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

10.04 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay and pavement markings on Tipton Highway from Hunt Road to US-12,
Lenawee County.  This is a Local Agency project.

032

STL 46000-206247

22-5141

As-SubmitttedBidder

Gerken Paving, Inc. $1,426,576.10

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $1,613,451.05

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 10, 2022 August 26, 2022

$712,729.75

No DBE participation required

2205

4.46 %

$744,495.08

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.34 mi of hot mix asphalt surfacing, concrete curb and gutter, earth excavation, aggregate base, drainage and
pavement markings on Church Street from US-41 to Mine Street, Wedge Street from Sixth Street to Spruce Street
and Mine Street from Church Street to Elm Street, Houghton County.  This is a Local Agency project.

033

STUL 31000-208242

22-5142

As-SubmitttedBidder

B & B Contracting, Calumet, Inc. $744,495.08

Bacco Construction Company $789,984.41

Payne & Dolan Inc. $833,208.56

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 September 15, 2022

$956,720.60

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

21.75 %

$1,164,784.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.54 mi of hot mix asphalt rehabilitation including 4 to 3 lane reduction, concrete pavement removal, pavement
repairs, concrete curb and gutter, ramps, signing and pavement markings on Flushing Road from Eldorado Drive
to Ballanger Highway, Genesee County.  This is a Local Agency project.

034

STU 25000-207631

22-5133

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rohde Bros. Excavating, Inc. $1,164,784.00

Superior Contracting Group L.L.C. $1,204,969.00

Zito Construction $1,334,554.00

Lois Kay Contracting Co. $1,351,912.82

Fessler & Bowman, Inc. $1,419,463.24

5Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award September 2, 2022

$3,422,915.10

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

8.89 %

$3,727,148.60

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

10.50 mi of hot mix asphalt crack sealing, wedging and resurfacing, aggregate shoulders, culvert replacements,
guardrail and pavement markings on Dryden Road from the east village limits of Metamora east to M-53, Lapeer
County.  This is a Local Agency project.

035

STL 44000-206918

22-5117

As-SubmitttedBidder

Ace-Saginaw Paving Company $3,727,148.60

Pyramid Paving and Contracting Co. $3,902,350.43

Ajax Paving Industries, Inc. $4,344,276.54

Cadillac Asphalt, L.L.C. $5,167,051.68

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award September 30, 2022

$664,203.50

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

5.22 %

$698,880.98

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.07 mi of hot mix asphalt surfacing, curb ramps and pavement markings on 4 Mile Road from Coit Avenue to
Plainfield Avenue (M-44) in the city of Grand Rapids, Kent County.  This is a Local Agency project.

036

ST 41000-205558

22-5125

As-SubmitttedBidder

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $698,880.98

Superior Asphalt, Inc. $735,355.00

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $837,514.99

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 June 1, 2023

$1,006,888.94

No DBE participation required

2205

13.68 %

$1,144,652.50

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.53 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling, widening and resurfacing, concrete curb, gutter and ramps, signing and
pavement markings on Irish Road from south of Lippincott Road northerly to Kearsley Creek, Genesee County.
This is a Local Agency project.

037

EDC 25000-207677

22-5129

As-SubmitttedBidder

Kennedy Excavating, Inc. $1,144,652.50

Superior Contracting Group L.L.C. $1,215,327.95

Zito Construction $1,345,741.25

Fessler & Bowman, Inc. $1,665,168.16

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 19, 2022

$363,199.00

No DBE participation required

2205

73.41 %

$629,832.60

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Install pedestrian crosswalks and sidewalk ramps on various routes at multiple intersections in the village of
Romeo, Macomb County.  This is a Small Business Program project.  Only those approved by MDOT as a Small
Business may be eligible to bid as a prime contractor.  This is a Local Agency project.

038

TAU 50000-212927

22-5138

As-SubmitttedBidder

Warren Contractors & Development, Inc. $629,832.60

L.J. Construction, Inc. $755,881.00

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 13, 2022 August 26, 2022

$972,848.00

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

4.37 %

$1,015,331.22

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.81 mi of hot mix asphalt base crushing, shaping and resurfacing, curb ramps and pavement markings on 6 Mile
Road from Alpine Avenue (M-37) easterly to Pine Island Drive, Kent County.  This is a Local Agency project.

039

STU 41000-205534

22-5145

As-SubmitttedBidder

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $1,015,331.22

Superior Asphalt, Inc. $1,045,550.00

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $1,175,669.00

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205 Low Bid:  

Engineer Estimate:  

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:  

Completion Date: September 30, 2022 

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.20 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, concrete curb, gutter, sidewalk and ramps, water main, sanitary sewer
and pavement markings on Main Street from Beech Street to Grand River Avenue in the village of Webberville,
Ingham County.  This is a Local Agency project.

040

STUL 33000-208783

22-5143

All Bids Rejected 
 
 
5/17/2022 



10 days after award November 11, 2022

$379,955.50

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

27.93 %

$486,063.20

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.21 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay and pavement markings on Slee Road from US-223 to Onsted Highway,
Lenawee County.  This is a Local Agency project.

041

STL 46000-206186

22-5140

As-SubmitttedBidder

Gerken Paving, Inc. $486,063.20

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $624,686.94

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award November 17, 2023

$5,299,045.00

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

9.45 %

$5,800,000.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.46 mi of brick pavement roadway reconstruction, storm sewer, concrete curb, gutter, sidewalk and ramps,
signing and pavement markings on Saginaw Street from the Flint River to Court Street in the city of Flint, Genesee
County.  This is a Local Agency project.

042

STU 25000-130632

22-5153

As-SubmitttedBidder

L. A. Construction, Corp. $5,800,000.00

Fessler & Bowman, Inc. $6,018,638.00

Angelo Iafrate Construction Company $6,057,542.00

Zito Construction $6,107,840.57

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 14, 2022

$1,175,049.25

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-6.89 %

$1,094,126.25

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.50 mi of hot mix asphalt crushing, shaping and resurfacing and pavement markings on County Road 581 from
Tony's Lane south to Rocky Creek, Marquette County.  This is a Local Agency project.

043

STL 52000-205655

22-5139

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $1,094,126.25

Bacco Construction Company $1,193,409.50

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award July 15, 2022

$428,543.40

No DBE participation required

2205

-0.10 %

$428,124.99

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.51 mi of hot mix asphalt wedging and overlay, signing and pavement markings on Sand Lake Road from M-55
south to Townline Road, Iosco County.  This is a Local Agency project.

044

STL 35000-205989

22-5116

As-SubmitttedBidder

Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $428,124.99

Pyramid Paving and Contracting Co. $475,350.49

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $480,906.65

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 26, 2022

$716,813.60

No DBE participation required

2205

8.41 %

$777,131.73

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.46 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction and pavement markings on Waasa Road from Salo Road to M-203,
Houghton County.  This is a Local Agency project.

045

STL 31000-206722

22-5152

As-SubmitttedBidder

MJO Contracting, Inc. $777,131.73

Bacco Construction Company $881,183.80

Payne & Dolan Inc. $897,833.65

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 November 15, 2022

$993,442.50

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

11.21 %

$1,104,808.55

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.74 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, storm sewer, curb ramps, signing and pavement markings on Dogwood
Drive from the north city limit of Ferrysburg to 174th Avenue in the city of Ferrysburg, Ottawa County.  This is a
Local Agency project.

046

STUL 70000-205368

22-5144

As-SubmitttedBidder

Jackson-Merkey Contractors, Inc. $1,104,808.55

Georgetown Construction Company $1,117,031.25

Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. $1,120,771.40

Davis Construction, Inc. $1,142,411.50

Brenner Excavating, Inc. $1,186,363.75

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $1,211,025.25

Wadel Stabilization, Inc. $1,221,744.25

Al's Excavating, Inc. $1,245,110.00

8Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award October 15, 2022

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including superstructure and substructure repairs, clean and seal deck joints and deck scaling
at the Douglas A. MacArthur Bridge over the Detroit River in the city of Detroit, Wayne County.

047

ST 82700-200121

This proposal has been withdrawn.



10 days after award June 30, 2023

$868,221.58

No DBE participation required

2205

7.56 %

$933,836.42

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Intelligent transportation system equipment upgrades on various routes, Berrien, Calhoun, Kalamazoo, Kent,
Mason, Osceola and Ottawa Counties.

048

ST 41131-212645

As-SubmitttedBidder

J. Ranck Electric, Inc. $933,836.42

Severance Electric Co., Inc. $1,096,811.00

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 10, 2022 August 19, 2022

$490,684.05

No DBE participation required

2205

7.85 %

$529,202.21

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

High load hit repair including structural steel repairs, heat straightening and partial painting on Cecil Avenue over I-
94 in the city of Detroit, Wayne County.

049

MER 82023-214748

As-SubmitttedBidder

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $529,202.21

Toebe Construction LLC $698,646.88

Abhe & Svoboda, Inc. $799,887.08

Z Contractors, Inc. $827,593.59

4Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022 July 15, 2023

$1,449,512.51

No DBE participation required

2205

35.71 %

$1,967,150.55

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.07 mi of culvert replacement, scour countermeasures, riprap, guardrail, signing and approach work on M-123
over Otto/Brant Creek, Luce County.

050

M 48032-212632

As-SubmitttedBidder

Bacco Construction Company $1,967,150.55

1Total Number of Bidders:



June 27, 2022 August 19, 2022

$496,878.01

No DBE participation required

2205

-2.28 %

$485,537.40

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including thin epoxy overlay and pavement markings at nine bridges on I-75 and Rau Road,
Ogemaw and Roscommon Counties. This project includes a 5 year epoxy overlay performance warranty.

051

M 65041-215071

As-SubmitttedBidder

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, L.L.C. $485,537.40

Smith's Waterproofing LLC $537,240.41

Ram Construction Services of Michigan, Inc. $567,142.27

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 1, 2022 June 15, 2023

$1,448,569.26

No DBE participation required

2205

4.17 %

$1,508,967.05

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.17 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, concrete curb and gutter, culvert replacement, sewer, drainage, scour
countermeasures, steel sheet piling, cofferdam, guardrail and pavement markings on M-15 at Duck Creek,
Oakland County.

052

M 63071-212434

As-SubmitttedBidder

Davis Construction, Inc. $1,508,967.05

DiPonio Contracting, Inc. $1,833,511.68

Superior Contracting Group L.L.C. $1,990,926.35

Toebe Construction LLC $2,150,718.69

Z Contractors, Inc. $2,247,451.25

Zito Construction $2,297,381.10

6Total Number of Bidders:



35 Working Days10 days after award

$2,267,228.70

No DBE participation required

2205

-3.07 %

$2,197,625.88

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

10.55 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing and pavement markings on M-34 from west of Dey
Highway to east of Benner Highway/Beecher Road, Lenawee County.

053

M 46041-214646

As-SubmitttedBidder

Gerken Paving, Inc. $2,197,625.88

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $2,859,630.49

2Total Number of Bidders:



September 12, 2022 October 31, 2022

$1,451,290.81

No DBE participation required

2205

-1.11 %

$1,435,252.60

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.20 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, shoulder repairs, guardrail and pavement markings on M-
115 from south of the Wexford county line northwesterly to north of South 41 Road with a gap in work at the
passing lane, Wexford County.

054

M 83051-214485

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $1,435,252.60

Elmer's Crane and Dozer, Inc. $1,595,419.29

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 1, 2022 October 14, 2022

$500,463.22

No DBE participation required

2205

-2.29 %

$488,995.72

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Crack sealing at 29 airports at various locations, statewide.

055

 84053-122001

As-SubmitttedBidder

Scodeller Construction, Inc. $488,995.72

Wolverine Sealcoating LLC $649,384.94

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, L.L.C. $849,976.68

Michigan Joint Sealing, Inc. $935,342.90

4Total Number of Bidders:



June 2, 2022 October 14, 2022

$404,252.87

No DBE participation required

2205

17.90 %

$476,606.08

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Airport pavement markings at 26 airports at various locations, statewide.

056

 84053-200181

As-SubmitttedBidder

P.K. Contracting, LLC $476,606.08

1Total Number of Bidders:



15 days after award

No DBE participation required

2205 Low Bid:  

Engineer Estimate:  

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:  

Completion Date: December 2, 2022 

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

5.24 mi of continuous welded rail (CWR) installation, crosstie installation, track surfacing culvert replacement and
turnout construction on state owned railroad right-of-way, Shiawassee, Livingston and Washtenaw Counties.

057

CTFR 76000-212006

All Bids Rejected 
 
 
5/31/2022 



10 days after award July 29, 2022

$328,279.00

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-0.55 %

$326,484.40

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.77 mi of hot mix asphalt resurfacing, aggregate shoulders and pavement markings on Wickert Road west of M-
65, Iosco County.  This is a Local Agency project.

058

STL 35000-205999

22-5137

As-SubmitttedBidder

Bolen Asphalt Paving, Inc. $326,484.40

Pyramid Paving and Contracting Co. $355,928.40

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $365,494.70

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 26, 2022

$119,540.16

No DBE participation required

2205

36.70 %

$163,407.68

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.85 mi of hot mix asphalt overlay and pavement markings on Bootjack Road south of Jacobsville Road, Houghton
County.  This is a Local Agency project.

059

STL 31000-214858

22-5154

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $163,407.68

Bacco Construction Company $169,439.68

2Total Number of Bidders:



June 6, 2022

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205 Low Bid:  

Engineer Estimate:  

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:  

Completion Date: May 26, 2023 

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.07 mi of construction of a roundabout including hot mix asphalt and concrete pavement, concrete curb, gutter,
sidewalk and ramps and pavement markings on East Lafayette Road at North Franks Avenue in the city of Sturgis,
St. Joseph County.  This is a Local Agency project.

060

HSIP 78000-211919

22-5165

 
 All Bids Rejected 
 
 
5/17/2022 



10 days after award November 11, 2022

$1,284,470.00

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

3.18 %

$1,325,325.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.99 mi of hot mix asphalt crushing, shaping and resurfacing, concrete curb and gutter and pavement markings on
Torrey Road from North Road to the north city limits of Fenton in the city of Fenton, Genesee County.  This is a
Local Agency project.

061

STU 25000-207638

22-5167

As-SubmitttedBidder

Ace-Saginaw Paving Company $1,325,325.00

Cadillac Asphalt, L.L.C. $1,579,974.43

Ajax Paving Industries, Inc. $1,744,261.88

3Total Number of Bidders:



July 25, 2022 September 16, 2022

$1,200,000.00

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

49.17 %

$1,790,033.00

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

3.50 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, preformed waterproofing membrane, curb ramp and
pavement markings on Lakewood Boulevard from Lakeshore Avenue easterly to 144th Avenue, Ottawa County.
This is a Local Agency project.

062

STUL 70000-206127

22-5164

As-SubmitttedBidder

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $1,790,033.00

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $1,881,226.70

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award September 30, 2022

$816,560.50

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

5.45 %

$861,041.25

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.90 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, concrete reconstruction, curb, gutter and sidewalk and
pavement markings on Riverview Avenue from Maywood Avenue to Cole Road in the city of Monroe, Monroe
County.  This is a Local Agency project.

063

STUL 58000-213364

22-5162

As-SubmitttedBidder

Cadillac Asphalt, L.L.C. $861,041.25

Ajax Paving Industries, Inc. $926,291.25

2Total Number of Bidders:



August 19, 2022 October 28, 2022

$1,790,565.50

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-5.68 %

$1,688,949.35

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.16 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, storm sewer, concrete curb, gutter and ramps, signing and
pavement markings on Lakewood Boulevard from 144th Avenue easterly to North River Avenue, Ottawa County
This is a Local Agency project.

064

HIC 70000-213136

22-5155

As-SubmitttedBidder

Kamminga & Roodvoets, Inc. $1,688,949.35

Georgetown Construction Company $1,955,675.50

Jackson-Merkey Contractors, Inc. $1,961,640.00

Al's Excavating, Inc. $1,978,000.00

Schippers Excavating, Inc. $1,992,225.00

5Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award September 20, 2024

$4,109,027.50

6.00 % DBE participation required

2205

15.15 %

$4,731,657.75

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.39 mi of hot mix asphalt shared-use path including a pedestrian bridge, fencing and pavement markings along
Zeeb Road south to Huron River Drive then runs along the south side of Huron River Drive to Loch Alpine Drive
then through the park to Delhi Court, Washtenaw County.  This is a Local Agency project.

065

TA 81000-204889

22-5156

As-SubmitttedBidder

L.J. Construction, Inc. $4,731,657.75

Davis Construction, Inc. $5,773,989.74

Fonson Company, Inc. $5,799,952.88

C. A. Hull Co., Inc. $5,858,800.81

Z Contractors, Inc. $6,528,806.49

E.T. MacKenzie Company $10,101,036.63

6Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award June 1, 2023

$1,068,947.85

4.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-6.89 %

$995,260.40

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.47 mi of hot mix asphalt base crushing, shaping and resurfacing, aggregate shoulders, replace culvert, guardrail
and pavement markings on Harrisburg Road from Ravenna Road east to Squires Road, Muskegon County.  This is
a Local Agency project.

066

STL 61000-205897

22-5166

As-SubmitttedBidder

Michigan Paving and Materials Company $995,260.40

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $1,042,621.50

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award November 15, 2023

$15,218,145.99

6.00 % DBE participation required

2205

2.40 %

$15,583,794.85

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

2.00 mi of concrete reconstruction, drainage, concrete curb, gutter, sidewalk and ramps and pavement markings
on 23 Mile Road from Romeo Plank Road to Heydenriech Road, Macomb County. This Project includes a 5 year
Concrete Local Agency Warranty. This is a Local Agency project.

067

EDC 50000-206644 , ETC

21-5495

As-SubmitttedBidder

Dan's Excavating, Inc. $15,583,794.85

M. L. Chartier Excavating, Inc. $17,584,592.39

Toebe Construction LLC $18,943,450.13

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award November 1, 2022

$100,957.00

No DBE participation required

2205

-35.51 %

$65,105.72

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Installation of opticom GPS units and pedestrian signals on Albert Road from Abbott Road to Collingwood Drive in
the city of East Lansing, Ingham County.  This is a Local Agency project.

068

CM 33000-207039

22-5163

As-SubmitttedBidder

J. Ranck Electric, Inc. $65,105.72

Severance Electric Co., Inc. $123,366.42

Rauhorn Electric, Inc. $157,819.63

3Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award November 4, 2022

$696,477.46

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

21.02 %

$842,903.20

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.70 mi of hot mix asphalt crushing, shaping and resurfacing, culverts, signing and pavement markings on Hansen
Road from Meyers Road to Dennis Road, Mason County. This is a Local Agency project.

069

STUL 53432-132919

22-5151

As-SubmitttedBidder

Elmer's Crane and Dozer, Inc. $842,903.20

Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. $878,537.68

2Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award

5.00 % DBE participation required

2205 Low Bid:  

Engineer Estimate:  

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:  
Completion Date: November 15, 2023 

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

1.28 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and resurfacing, curb repairs, concrete sidewalk and ramps, and pavement
markings on Grand River Avenue from Appian Way to North Street and from St. Paul Street to Ore Creek in the
city of Brighton, Livingston County.  This is a Local Agency project.

070

STUL 47000-210622

22-5175

. All Bids Rejected  
 
 
4/17/2022 



January 15, 2023 September 1, 2023

$3,158,582.50

6.00 % DBE participation required

2205

6.47 %

$3,362,875.02

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

0.69 mi of hot mix asphalt reconstruction, concrete pavement, aggregate base, storm sewer, sidewalk upgrades,
signing and pavement markings on 9 Mile Road from west city limit of Eastpointe to Gratiot Avenue in the city of
Eastpointe, Macomb County.  This is a Local Agency project.

071

STU 50000-206512

22-5171

As-SubmitttedBidder

Florence Cement Company $3,362,875.02

Mark Anthony Contracting, Inc. $3,437,223.65

M. L. Chartier Excavating, Inc. $3,583,138.00

Toebe Construction LLC $4,908,421.63

4Total Number of Bidders:



10 days after award August 15, 2022

$563,378.23

No DBE participation required

2205

-0.24 %

$562,032.64

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

11.52 mi of catch basin repairs on various routes at multiple locations in the cities of Auburn Hills, Birmingham,
Ferndale, Huntington Woods, Pleasant Ridge and Royal Oak, village of Clarkston, Oakland County.

072

M 63172-215252

As-SubmitttedBidder

Century Cement Company, Inc. $562,032.64

Great Lakes Contracting Solutions, LLC $667,180.20

Merlo Construction Company, Inc. $672,333.00

Major Contracting Group, Inc. $786,833.11

Superior Contracting Group L.L.C. $1,089,718.00

5Total Number of Bidders:



July 11, 2022 September 30, 2022

$935,469.00

3.00 % DBE participation required

2205

-16.33 %

$782,733.54

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

23.94 mi of guardrail removal, replacement and slope flattening on US-31 from south of Elk Lake Road to south of
Richardson Road, Antrim County.

073

HSIP 05011-213919

As-SubmitttedBidder

Action Traffic Maintenance, Inc. $782,733.54

Nashville Construction Company $797,501.58

Dale Dukes & Sons, Inc. $865,937.20

3Total Number of Bidders:



210 Calendar DaysOctober 1, 2022

$1,272,943.56

No DBE participation required

2205

15.78 %

$1,473,765.85

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Traffic signal modernizations and concrete sidewalk ramp improvements on various routes at multiple
intersections, Berrien County.

074

CM 11016-207778

22-5115

As-SubmitttedBidder

Wright Electric Company, Inc. $1,473,765.85

J. Ranck Electric, Inc. $1,520,287.43

Severance Electric Co., Inc. $1,560,268.35

3Total Number of Bidders:



June 13, 2022 September 23, 2022

$444,725.34

No DBE participation required

2205

33.41 %

$593,306.59

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

Bridge rehabilitation including concrete deck and brush block patching on M-35 over Portage Creek, and US-2
over Whitefish Creek, Tenderfoot Creek, and Cisco branch of the Ontonagon River, Delta and Gogebic Counties.

075

M 27023-215545

As-SubmitttedBidder

Hebert Construction Co. $593,306.59

1Total Number of Bidders:



18 Working DaysSeptember 12, 2022

$1,070,394.09

No DBE participation required

2205

-2.55 %

$1,043,081.60

Engineer Estimate:

Low Bid:

Pct Over/Under Estimate:

Letting Call:

Project:

Start Date: Completion Date:

Local Agreement:

Letting of May 06, 2022

Description:

4.62 mi of hot mix asphalt cold milling and overlay, shoulder gravel, centerline and shoulder corrugations and
pavement markings on M-35 from north of County Road 444 to south of Northwestern Lake Road then north of
Bodenus Drive, Marquette County.

076

M 52031-215564

As-SubmitttedBidder

Payne & Dolan Inc. $1,043,081.60

Bacco Construction Company $1,055,963.70

2Total Number of Bidders:


